
 

 

 

 

SB 555: Fair Wage Act of 2023  

SB 803: Labor and Employment - Payment of Minimum Wage - Tipped Employees 

Senate Finance Committee │ March 2, 2023 

Position: SUPPORT 

The National Women’s Law Center (NWLC) submits this testimony in strong support of SB 555, the Fair 
Wage Act, and SB 803 (the “One Fair Wage” bill). SB 555 will accelerate Maryland’s minimum wage 
increase to reach $15 an hour by October 2023 and tie future increases to the consumer price index—
giving approximately 217,000 workers in Maryland a raise, disproportionately women and people of 
color.1 The Fair Wage Act will boost pay for roughly one in eight Black and Latinx workers in Maryland; 
among all workers who will get a raise, nearly six in 10 (58%) are women.2 SB 803 will include tipped 
workers in this increase by July 2027. Both bills are essential to address the pervasive and longstanding 
pay disparities that women, and especially women of color, face in Maryland—disparities that were only 
exacerbated by the COVID-19 pandemic.3 

Since 1972, NWLC has fought for gender justice—in the courts, in public policy, and in our society—
working across the issues that are central to the lives of women and girls. NWLC advocates for 
improvement and enforcement of our nation’s employment and civil rights laws, with a particular focus on 
the needs of LGBTQI+ people, women of color, and women with low incomes and their families. Ensuring 
that all workers in Maryland are entitled to the same fair minimum wage, regardless of tips, is a critical 
way to boost women’s paychecks, combating poverty and persistent racial and gender pay gaps. 

Women working full time, year-round in Maryland typically make only 86 percent of what their male 
counterparts make, leaving a wage gap of 14 cents on the dollar.4 This wage gap varies by race and is 
larger for many women of color.5 One driver of these wage gaps is women’s overrepresentation in low-
paid jobs.6 In Maryland, roughly six in ten workers in the state’s lowest-paying jobs are women,7 as are 
more than two-thirds (69%) of tipped workers; more than one-third (35%) of tipped workers in Maryland 
are women of color.8 Especially in states like Maryland where employers can pay just a few dollars an 
hour before tips, tipped workers experience poverty at far higher rates than the workforce overall9—and 
they also experienced job loss, reduced tips, and great risks to their health and safety during the height of 
the pandemic.10 

Today, while Maryland law continues to allow employers to pay tipped workers a base wage of just $3.63 
an hour, many question whether they should stay in a profession that leaves them vulnerable to 
harassment and scrambling to pay their bills11—and many who have already left question whether they 
should return.12 Meanwhile, the neighboring District of Columbia will begin raising its tipped minimum 
wage from $5.05 per hour to $16.10 per hour by 2027, after voters overwhelmingly approved Initiative 82 
on the November 2022 ballot.13 If Maryland does not offer competitive wages for tipped workers, 
employers in neighboring counties will continue to see an exodus of workers from Maryland’s restaurant 
industry to more attractive pay in the District of Columbia.14  

Raising wages now for Maryland’s lowest paid workers, including tipped workers, will also benefit 
children, families, and the state’s economy. Especially in light of recent inflation, many families are 
struggling to afford the basics; today, one in 10 children in Maryland has a parent making less than $15 
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per hour.15 SB 555 would give these families a much-needed income boost—which research shows can 
also benefit children’s health and well-being.16 

Decades of research studying the impact of state and local minimum wage increases also show that 
these measures consistently improve incomes for workers and their families without costing jobs.17 
Similarly, in the seven states that adopted One Fair Wage prior to the pandemic, this policy has not 
harmed growth in the restaurant industry or tipped jobs: from 2011 to 2019, One Fair Wage states had 
stronger restaurant growth than states that had a lower tipped minimum wage18—and while the pandemic 
hit the industry hard, the leisure and hospitality sector has not fared worse in recent years in One Fair 
Wage states than in states with lower wages for tipped workers.19 Indeed, because underpaid workers 
spend much of their extra earnings in their communities, increasing the minimum wage—including the 
wage for tipped workers—will help ensure a strong, shared recovery in the wake of the COVID-19 
pandemic.20 And higher wages can further benefit employers by reducing turnover and increasing 
productivity.21 

The Fair Wage Act of 2023 and the One Fair Wage bill will lift up working families during this period of 
high inflation and, because women are the majority of workers who will see their pay go up, wage gaps 
will likely narrow as well.22 Enacted together, these bills will work to diminish historic inequities—
but enacting the Fair Wage Act without the One Fair Wage bill would once again leave many 
women and people of color behind. 

The Fair Wage Act of 2023 and the One Fair Wage bill are two critical and complementary tools to ensure 
that women can work with equality, safety, and dignity—starting with equal and adequate pay. We 
respectfully request a favorable report of both SB 555 and SB 803.  

* * * 

Please do not hesitate to contact Diana Ramirez at dramirez@nwlc.org if you have questions or require 
additional information. Thank you for your consideration. 
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