
Madam Chair and Committee: 

 

Seth Miller FWA. 

 

Thank you for your service. 

 

Senator Salling thank you. My views my own. 
First Amendment. 

 

Dignity and decorum of government serve not 
to elevate governing over governed but to 
remind office holders of an oath of office.  

 

Initially, all I asked that every inpatient have 
their own outgoing landline at no cost to patient 
or family after two attacks on my paraplegic 
roommate. The first by a third roommate. The 
second by staff. I was not weight bearing. 
Fortunately I had an IPhone. There would be no 



Police Report had there been no first attack. No 
report for the second attack. Per their own letter 
to me, MDH did not make a site visit and took 
the word of the director of nurses and patient’s 
physician that there was no evidence of physical 
abuse. Conflict of interest. False. When I 
discharged Brian‘s face was black and blue. 

 

There is a class action against MDH for seldom 
conducting investigations. When they do 
investigate, they don’t have to conduct site 
visits. 

 

Covid hit. The Washington Post reports MDH 
fined the site for easily preventable deaths. Had 
MDH listened when I complained about the 
attacks on my roommate staff would’ve turned 
around. Nobody cares. 

 



MDH is against phones. Concerns about 
ligature, forensic patients, and cost are pre-
textual. My site was private equity owned. They 
had phone jacks. Charging patients is for money 

 

We do not pay through Medicaid and exchange 
for patients to be attacked and private equity to 
be enriched. Get private facility patients phones 
through the Universal Service Administrative 
Company subsidy offered by the FCC with sites, 
making up the difference. And providing phones 
for ineligible patients. Info. Attached. Rights of 
action or private rights of action and attorneys 
fees for OAG, local health departments, 
patients, families, healthcare providers, and 
insurance. Deal with state sites later.  

 

MDH‘s position is inconsistent with the 
governor’s proclamation that October was 



patient rights month calling on patients to self-
advocate. 

 

How would the governor like his mother who 
was at his inauguration treated like that? Ditto 
for long term care lobbyists. Leave no one 
behind. 

 

https://www.usac.org/ 

 

 

 

 






























